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Anvone requesting records are required to pay $.25 per page after the
first four (4) pages.

W [Cellios

ozaﬁ“/@@f”’



w : s

3008 Rosetta Dy, Chamatte, Lovisina,
Rowtta B, Chalmatla, Loisizng, 7004

o % X
i

£ WRROETTAIR
LOmENTS

WOUED W

WIDE TR
ERC0E B

FG, TP
wen ]
AL 0

ACRG 1
qUPD AN
WU 1220
ADFRET  WBROSETE o
S R Lo
TR P " A 3

o

W

o

T
W 3ot




Michelle Walsh

From: Michelle Walsh

Sent: Monday, August 01, 2016 11:59 AM
To: Michelle Walsh

Subject: RE: Public Records Request "PRR"

I've requested the information from Community Development. | will let you know once they respond.
Also, | have your DVD of the meeting. The cost is $25. Please make the check to St. Bernard Parish Government.

Michelle

From: Michelle Walsh

Sent: Monday, August 01, 2016 9:10 AM
To: 'Cathy Moore'

Subject: RE: Public Records Request "PRR"

Ms. Moore we are working on getting this DVD copied for you. | will notify you when complete.
Michelle

From: Cathy Moore [mailto:cmooretgh@gmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, July 30, 2016 11:26 PM

To: Michelle Walsh

Subject: Re: Public Records Request "PRR"

That is correct. I would like a copy of DVD from Tuesday's meeting.
Thanks,
C. Moore

On Fri, Jul 29, 2016 at 1:04 PM, Michelle Walsh <mwalsh@sbpg.net> wrote:

Ms. Moore,

I am in receipt of your PRR and would like to clarify what you are in need of. Did you need
minutes of a meeting (July 26, 2016) or a copy of the DVD or some other information? I just
want to make sure I get you the information you need.

Thanks




